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Dear Editor,

We  read  with  interest  the  article  by  Hoffmeister,  Caro,  and  Lavados
(2024)  on  adherence  to  the  Mediterranean  diet  and  stroke  risk  in  a
Chilean population (1). The study provides relevant epidemiological and
clinical  evidence,  with  a  methodology  that  is  well  aligned  with  its
objectives. Our purpose is not to criticize the study, but rather to invite a
broader  reflection  on  how  dietary  adherence  is  studied—particularly
when it involves eating patterns shaped by strong cultural dimensions.



Adherence to a dietary model is influenced not only by its nutritional
components  but  also  by  symbolic,  social,  and  territorial  factors.  The
Mediterranean diet,  though well-supported in the literature,  originates
from  a  specific  cultural  and  historical  context.  Its  adoption  in  non-
Mediterranean populations often entails  challenges related to culinary
traditions,  perceptions,  and  food  availability.  In  this  regard,  Ñuble—
where  this  study  was  conducted—is  a  unique  region  in  the  central-
southern zone of Chile,  with distinct agro-ecological  and cultural  food
identities. Exploring how sociocultural factors shape adherence patterns
in this setting could offer valuable insights.
Previous studies have shown that gender roles,  education level,  local
traditions,  and  social  practices  influence  both  the  perception  and
implementation  of  dietary  recommendations  (2-5).  Therefore,  we
suggest  that  future  research  could  benefit  from  complementary
methodologies  that  incorporate  qualitative,  ethnographic,  or
interdisciplinary perspectives. Cultural adaptation of interventions, such
as  the  educational  and  nutritional  program  described  by  Morales-
Fernández et al. (6), has been associated with improved effectiveness.
Moreover,  combining  such  approaches  with  geospatial  tools  like
Geographic Information Systems (GIS) could help map how cultural and
territorial variables interact in shaping adherence behaviors (7,8).
This  proposal  is  not  intended  to  replace  traditional  epidemiological
frameworks but rather to enrich them. By adopting a broader and more
integrative perspective, we may better understand the complex drivers
of  dietary  adherence  and  design  more  sustainable,  context-sensitive,
and equitable interventions.
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